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St Helens CCG 
The Gamble Building 
Victoria Square 
St Helens 
WA10 1DY 
 
 

Dear Sir/ Madam 
 
Re: Freedom of Information Request 
 
Further to your recent Freedom of Information request regarding LD Placements, please see 
below our response to your request. 
 
Request: 
 

Under the Freedom of Information Act, I would like to request the following information 

regarding adult learning disability services. Where possible, please kindly include responses 

on the attached Excel spreadsheet. 

 

1. Please could you supply the name, email address and telephone number of the 

commissioner with responsibility for learning disabilities placements? 

2. For questions 2 to 6, please supply this information as a snapshot at the end of the year 

for the financial years 2017/18 to 2018/19, and where possible, the most up to date 

snapshot available for 2019/20. 

3. Please provide the total number of adults with learning disabilities funded by the CCG in 

residential care.  

4. Of the total number of adults with learning disabilities funded by the CCG in residential 

care (q.2) please provide the number that are in ‘in area’ placements and the number 

that are in ‘out of area’ placements.  

5. Please provide the total number of adults with learning disabilities funded by the CCG in 

supported living.  

6. Please provide the number of adults with learning disabilities who transitioned from 

children’s learning disabilities services into adult’s services - in total, into adult residential 

care services only, and into adult supported living services only.  

7. Please provide the number of adults with learning disabilities who ‘stepped down’ from 

specialist inpatient hospital placements into adult residential care and supported living 

services.  

8. Please provide the CCG’s total expenditure on residential care and supported living for 

adults with learning disabilities for each of the financial years 2017/18 to 2018/19, and 

where possible, budgeted expenditure for 2019/20. If expenditure for 2019/20 is not yet 

available, please provide projected expenditure. 

9. Please provide the highest, lowest, and average weekly rate paid by the CCG for 

residential care placements for adults with a learning disability for each of the financial 

years 2017/18 to 2018/19. If the CCG has weekly rate bands, please also provide these. 

mailto:sthelensccg.foi@nhs.net


10. Please provide the highest, lowest, and average hourly rate paid by the CCG for 

supported living placements for adults with a learning disability for each of the financial 

years 2017/18 to 2018/19. If the CCG has hourly rate bands, please also provide these. 

 
Response: 
 
Please see Spreadsheet attached. 
 
Should you require any further information or clarification regarding this response or do not 
feel that your request has been answered as you would expect, please contact us to discuss.  
 
We also wish to take this opportunity to inform you that a formal complaints and internal 
review process is available, which will be managed by a FOI Appeals Officer. 
 
This can be formally requested and must be done within a reasonable period of time (3 
calendar months) from the date this response was issued.  
 
Where you are not satisfied with the response to a request for information that falls within the 
Environmental Information Regulations, you should make a representation for a review to 
FOI Appeals Officer, sthelensccg.foi@nhs.net within 40 days of receipt of the response. 
 
If you are not satisfied with our review under the Freedom of Information Act or the 
Environmental Information Regulations, you may apply directly to the Information 
Commissioners Office (ICO) for a review of your appeal decision.  Generally, the ICO cannot 
make a decision unless you have exhausted our complaints procedure.  
 
The ICO can be contacted at;  
 
ICO, Wycliffe House, Water Lane, Wilmslow, Cheshire, SK9 5AF  
www.ico.gov.uk   
 
Should you need any further clarification or assistance, please do not hesitate to contact me 
quoting the above reference. 
 
Yours sincerely,  
 

 
 
Angela Delea 
Associate Director – Corporate Governance 
NHS St Helens Clinical Commissioning Group    
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http://www.ico.gov.uk/


CCG

Date:

1. Please could you supply the name, email address and telephone number of the 

commissioner with responsibility for learning disabilities placements. 
Name Job title Telelphone No. Email Address

Gill Whittle

Service 

Manager: 

Vulnerable 

Adults.

Integrated 

Commissionin

g Team

c/o 01744 457270GillianWhittle@sthelens.gov.uk

2. Please provide the total number of adults with learning disabilities funded by the CCG in 

residential care. Please supply this information as a snapshot at the end of the year for the 

financial years 2017/18 to 2018/19, and where possible, the most up to date snapshot available 

for 2019/20.

2017/18 2018/19 2019/20

Total in residential care 14 14 13

3. Of the total number of adults with learning disabilities funded by the CCG in residential care 

(q.2) please provide the number that are in ‘in area’ placements and the number that are in ‘out 

of area’ placements. Please supply this information as a snapshot at the end of the year for the 

financial years 2017/18 to 2018/19, and where possible, the most up to date snapshot available 

for 2019/20.

2017/18 2018/19 2019/20

In area N/A - The CCG do not hold this information (in this format)

Out of area

4. Please provide the total number of adults with learning disabilities funded by the CCG in 

supported living. Please supply this information as a snapshot at the end of the year for the 

financial years 2017/18 to 2018/19, and where possible, the most up to date snapshot available 

for 2019/20.

2017/18 2018/19 2019/20

Total in supported living 39 51 56

5. Please provide the number of adults with learning disabilities who transitioned from 

children’s learning disabilities services into adult's services - in total, into adult residential care 

services only, and into adult supported living services only. Please supply the total number that 

transitioned in each of the financial years 2017/18 to 2018/19, and where possible, the number 

that have transitioned to date in 2019/20.

2017/18 2018/19 2019/20

Total transitioned 0 1 0

Transitioned to residential care 0 1 0

Transitioned to supported living 0 0 0

6. Please provide the number of adults with learning disabilities who ‘stepped down’ from 

specialist inpatient hospital placements into adult residential care and supported living 

services. Please supply the total number that stepped down in each of the financial years 

2017/18 to 2018/19, and where possible, the number that have stepped down to date in 

2019/20.

2017/18 2018/19 2019/20

Stepped down into residential care 1

Stepped down into supported living 1 1 1

7. Please provide the local authority’s total expenditure on residential care and supported living 

for adults with learning disabilities for each of the financial years 2017/18 to 2018/19, and 

where possible, budgeted expenditure for 2019/20. If expenditure for 2019/20 is not yet 

available, please provide projected expenditure. 

2017/18 2018/19 2019/20

Total expenditure on residential care

Total expenditure on supported living

8. Please provide the highest, lowest, and average weekly rate paid by the CCG for residential 

care placements for adults with a learning disability for each of the financial years 2017/18 to 

2018/19. If the Local Authority has weekly rate bands, please also provide these. 

2017/18 2018/19 2019/20

Highest weekly rate, £ £5,075 £4,903 £4,903

Lowest weekly rate, £ £273 £541 £541

Average weekly rate, £ £1,687 £1,720 £1,704

Weekly rate bands, £ (if used)

9. Please provide the highest, lowest, and average hourly rate paid by the CCG for supported 

living placements for adults with a learning disability for each of the financial years 2016/17 to 

2018/19. If the Local Authority has hourly rate bands, please also provide these. 

2017/18 2018/19 2019/20

Highest hourly rate, £

Lowest hourly rate, £

Average hourly rate, £

Hourly rate bands, £ (if used) £13 £14 £14

NHS St Helens CCG

14/11/2019

FOI Answers

N/A - Please redirect your enquiry to the Local Authority 

directly, the CCG do not hold this information
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